Lili Hsu

From: Steve Loczy

Sent: Tuesday, August 27, 2019 7:34 AM
To: Andy Devin; Lili Hsu; Jim Flucke
Subject: RE: Reminder of Deadline

Hi Lili,

Yes, these tax rates are still correct.
Thank you,

Stephen Loczy
Westar Energy and KCP&L, Evergy Companies
Tax Accountant Sr

0: 785-575-8210 M: 785-806-3798

kcpl.com
westarenergy.com

evergyinc.com

If you've received this message in error, I apologize for the inconvenience. Please don't distribute it. Instead,
please just delete it and respond to let me know of my error. Then, have a wonderful day.

From: Regulatory File Management System@westarenergy.com <Production.Enablement@Westarenergy.com>

Sent: Tuesday, August 27, 2019 5:00 AM

To: Andy Devin <Andy.Devin@evergy.com>; Lili Hsu <lili.hsu@evergy.com>; Steve Loczy <Stephen.Loczy@evergy.com>;
Jim Flucke <jim.flucke @evergy.com>

Subject: Reminder of Deadline

Title: Westar's Annual Transmission Revenue Requirement (ATRR)

Click here to view

Docket No:

Deadline: Tax Rates

Hi Andy and Steve,

We are beginning the process of updating the projected Westar TFR. Please confirm the below tax rates are correct.
FIT = 21.00%

SIT=7.00%

p =0.00%

Please return this data to me by August 30. Thank you for your help! Let me know if you have any questions.

Lili
816-654-1990



Please contact Maia Tichenor with any questions.



